TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

A. DUCTILE IRON PIPE

COMPANY

ITEM FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO.,, E.J.
NO. QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT

1 1000 FEET |12" Ductile Iron Pipe $31.50 $31.37 No Bid No Bid $32.87

2 100 FEET |10" Ductile Iron Pipe $27.50 $27.41 No Bid No Bid $28.75

3 1000 FEET |8" Ductile Iron Pipe $19.00 $18.98 No Bid No Bid $19.90

4 1000 FEET |6" Ductile Iron Pipe $13.95 $13.91 No Bid No Bid $14.57

5 100 FEET |4" Ductile Pipe $12.75 $12.69 No Bid No Bid $13.30

*Ductile Iron Pipe is manufactured to the latest revision of
those standards mentioned in this bid. Prices are F.O.B. job
site with the consignee to unload. Payment Terms: Net (30)
days.
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

B, MAIN PIPE FITTINGS / REPAIR CLAMPS / WATER SERVICE & GATE BOXES (Item 6-121)
COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO,, E.J.
IITEM NOJ QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
6 12 EACH |12" MJ Water Gate $1,350.00 $1,364.57 $1,099.00 No Bid $1,375.00
7 4 EACH [12" X 1/4 MJ bend $164.00 $163.40 $170.67 No Bid No Bid
8 4 EACH |12" X 1/8 MJ bend $136.00 $135.32 $141.34 No Bid No Bid
9 4 EACH [12" X 1/16 MJ bend $119.00 $118.47 $123.74 No Bid No Bid
10 4 EACH [12" X 1/32" mj bend $111.00 $110.81 $115.74 No Bid No Bid
11 2 EACH [12" mj tree $228.00 $227.74 $237.87 No Bid No Bid
12 2 EACH [12" X 10" mj tee $229.00 $228.77 $238.94 No Bid No Bid
13 1 EACH [12" X 8" mj tee $118.00 $177.70 $185.60 No Bid No Bid
14 4 EACH [12" X 6" mj tee $154.00 $153.70 $160.54 No Bid No Bid
15 2 EACH [12" X 6" hydrant tee $159.00 $158.30 $165.34 No Bid No Bid
16 12 EACH [12" mega lug 1100 $60.00 $60.69 $76.07 No Bid No Bid
10" resillent wedge valve
17 4 EACH [meuller $1,057.00 $1,078.41 $901.20 No Bid $1,095.00
18 4 EACH [10" x 1/4" mj bend $122.00 $121.53 $126.94 No Bid No Bid
19 4 EACH [10" x 1/8" mj bend $91.00 $90.38 $94.40 No Bid No Bid
20 4 EACH [10" x 1/16" mj bend $90.00 $89.87 $93.87 No Bid No Bid
21 4 EACH [10" x 1/32" mj bend $90.00 $89.36 $93.34 No Bid No Bid
22 4 EACH [10" x 10" mj bend $163.00 $162.89 $170.14 No Bid No Bid
23 EACH [10" x 8" mj bend $143.00 $142.47 $148.80 No Bid No Bid
24 4 EACH [10" x 6" mj tee $122.00 $122.04 $127.47 No Bid No Bid
25 2 EACH [10" x 6" hydrant tee $140.00 $139.40 $145.60 No Bid No Bid
26 12 EACH |10" mega lug 1100 series $42.00 $42.55 $58.14 No Bid No Bid
8" resllent wedge valve
27 4 EACH |mueller A2370-20 $678.00 $691.64 $553.50 No Bid $705.00
8" x 1/4" mechanical
28 4 EACH [joint bend $77.00 $76.60 $80.00 No Bid No Bid
8" x 1/8" mechanical
29 4 EACH |joint bend $62.00 $61.79 $64.54 No Bid No Bid

2 0f 18




TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO., E.J.
IITEM NOJ QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT

8" x 1/16" mechanical

30 4 EACH [joint bend $61.00 $60.26 $62.94 No Bid No Bid
8" x 1/32" mechanical

31 EACH [joint bend $56.00 $55.15 $57.60 No Bid No Bid

32 3 EACH [8" Mechanical joint tee $114.00 $113.87 $118.94 No Bid No Bid
8"x 6" mechanical joint

33 6 EACH |tee $95.00 $94.47 $98.67 No Bid No Bid

34 2 EACH (8" x 6" hydrant tee $110.00 $109.79 $114.67 No Bid No Bid

35 12 EACH [8" mega lug 1100 series $28.00 $28.19 $40.07 No Bid No Bid
6" resillent wedge valve

36 3 EACH [mueller A2370-20 $426.00 $434.26 $346.75 No Bid $440.00
6" x 1/4" mechanical joint

37 6 EACH [bend $53.00 $52.09 $54.40 No Bid No Bid
6" x 1/8" mechanical joint

38 4 EACH [bend $43.00 $42.38 $44.27 No Bid No Bid
6" x 1/16" mechanical

39 4 EACH [joint bend $39.00 $28.81 $40.54 No Bid No Bid
6" x 1/32" mechanical

40 4 EACH [joint bend $41.00 $40.34 $42.14 No Bid No Bid

41 2 EACH [6" mechanical joint tee $76.00 $76.04 $79.47 No Bid No Bid

42 2 EACH [6" hydrant tee $88.00 $87.32 $91.20 No Bid No Bid
6" megalug clamp 1100

43 30 EACH |series $19.00 $18.48 $30.60 No Bid No Bid

44 2 EACH (6" tite on plug $31.00 $33.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO., E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT

6" hydrant extension for

mueller centurion or
45 10 EACH [metropolitan 94 $282.00 $315.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12" Hydrant extension for

Mueller centurion or
46 10 EACH |Metropolitan $331.00 $370.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid

18" Hydrant extension for

Mueller centurion or
47 10 EACH |Metrolitan 94 $375.00 $419.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid
48 4 EACH |12" x 12 1/2" S-B 226 $92.06 No Bid $100.03 $96.48 $95.00
49 4 EACH |12" x 15" S-B 226 $109.23 No Bid $113.09 $109.08 $120.00
50 2 EACH |12" x 20" S-B 226 $148.73 No Bid $157.65 $152.07 $165.00
51 1 EACH |10" x 15" S-B 226 $99.27 No Bid $99.41 $95.89 $105.00
52 1 EACH [10" x 20" S-B 226 $130.66 No Bid $132.73 $128.03 $140.00
53 4 EACH (8" x 12 1/2" S-B 226 $66.72 No Bid $67.38 $64.99 $75.00
54 2 EACH [8" x 15" S-B 226 $79.50 No Bid $79.43 $76.62 $85.00
55 4 EACH [6" x 12 1/2" S-B 226 $56.90 No Bid $59.17 $57.07 $63.00
56 2 EACH [6" x 15" S-B 226 $66.49 No Bid $69.35 $66.89 $73.00
57 1 EACH [4" x 12 1/2" S-B 226 $49.40 No Bid $52.14 $50.29 $52.00
58 1 EACH [4" x 15" S-B 226 $58.92 No Bid $64.82 $62.52 $62.00
59 2 EACH [12" x 7 1/2" x 1" S-B 238 $82.47 No Bid $80.63 $77.77 $85.00
60 2 EACH [10" x 7 1/2" x 1" S-B 238 $75.35 No Bid $73.10 $70.51 $80.00
61 2 EACH |8"x 7 1/2" x 1" S-B 238 $60.83 No Bid $60.15 $58.01 $65.00
62 2 EACH [6" x 7 1/2" x 1" S-B 238 $53.81 No Bid $53.94 $52.52 $59.00
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO,, E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
63 2 EACH [3" S-B 411 $29.43 No Bid $55.58 $53.60 $35.00
64 2 EACH |2 1/2" S-B 411 $28.10 No Bid $50.79 $48.98 $30.00
65 2 EACH [2" S-B 411 $18.19 No Bid $37.27 $35.94 $21.00
66 2 EACH |1 1/2" S-B 411 $16.05 No Bid $28.72 $27.70 $18.00
67 4 EACH |1 1/4" S-B 411 $13.45 No Bid $24.75 $23.87 $14.00
68 12 EACH [1"S-B 411 $12.84 No Bid $24.62 $23.56 $14.00
69 2 EACH |3/4" s-B 411 $12.41 No Bid $22.59 $21.78 $13.00
70 8 EACH [12" 441 OMNI 13.20-13.50 $96.24 No Bid $103.40 $99.74 $105.00
71 8 EACH |10" 441 OMNI 11.60-11.10 $79.92 No Bid $87.38 $84.28 $85.00
72 8 EACH (8" 441 OMNI 9.05-9.45 $62.24 No Bid $61.53 $59.35 $67.00
73 8 EACH |6" 441 OMNI 6.90-7.22 $45.54 No Bid $46.10 $44.47 $48.00
74 8 EACH [4" 441 OMNI 5.11-5.45 $35.51 No Bid $33.80 $32.60 $37.00
12" x 2" Style 313 smith blair .
75 1 EACH service saddle $36.44 No Bid $50.13 $48.35 $38.00
12" x 1 1/2" Style 313 smith .
76 1 EACH blair service saddle $35.73 No Bid $50.13 $48.35 $38.00
12" x 1 1/4" Style 313 smith .
77 1 EACH blair service saddle $35.73 No Bid $50.13 $48.35 $38.00
12" x 1" Style 313 smith blair .
78 1 EACH service saddle $28.65 No Bid $39.69 $38.28 $31.00
12" x 3/4" Style 313 smith blair .
79 1 EACH service saddle $28.65 No Bid $39.69 $38.28 $31.00
10" x 2" Style 313 smith blair .
80 1 EACH service saddle $30.85 No Bid $40.15 $38.72 $34.00
10" x 1 1/2" Style 313 smith .
81 1 EACH blair service saddle $30.70 No Bid $40.15 $38.72 $34.00
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON | VELLANO | TI-SALES, | STILES CO., E.J.
ITEM NOJ QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC.| INC. INC. PRESCOTT
82 1 EACH igirxslerlvlifessgézlil3 smith $30.40 No Bid $40.15 $38.72 $34.00
83 1 |EACH|LD XU Syle S13 smith blar $26.47 No Bid $31.11 $30.00 $29.00
84 1 EACH igrv’fczl ‘S‘aj;’l’ée 313 smith blair $26.49 No Bid $31.11 $30.00 $29.00
85 1 |EACH|2 X2 Sule S13 smith blar $23.05 No Bid $31.93 $30.80 $25.00
86 1 EACH gerﬁlielfad%ﬁfe 313 smithblair | ¢>3.05 No Bid $31.93 $30.80 $25.00
87 1 |EACH| X LI Syle SIS smi bl gpy 37 No Bid $31.93 $30.80 $29.00
88 1 EACH ger)iniessgliilim smith blair $19.08 No Bid $25.59 $24.68 $21.00
89 1 |EACH|Z X3 S 313 smith blar $19.01 No Bid $25.59 $28.68 $21.00
90 1 EACH ger);ieSsZéZEB smith blair $20.86 No Bid $28.47 $27.45 $23.00
91 1 |EACH|2 X112 Swie 13 smibar] - g0 50 No Bid $28.47 $27.45 $23.00
92 1 EACH gerﬁie”:ad%ﬁfe 313 smith blair | 650,59 No Bid $28.47 $27.45 $23.00
93 1 [EACH|2 XL Sule S13 smith blar $16.92 No Bid $23.37 $22.54 $19.00
94 1 |EACH|2 X3 Se 313 smith blair $16.92 No Bid $23.37 $22.54 $19.00
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO,, E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
95 100  |EACH |Model #1 Buffalo 5 service $26.24 $29.69 $27.50 $26.85 No Bid
box complete
96 40 |EAcH |Model#1 Buffalo service $16.57 $18.75 $17.50 $16.70 No Bid
box top section
97 20  |EAcH |Model#1 Buffalo service $15.47 $17.50 $18.75 $17.25 No Bid
box bottom section
98 20  |EACH |16 Model #1 Buffalo $15.47 $17.50 $18.75 $18.40 No Bid
service box extension
Buffalo Style 664 extension
99 60 EACH |gate box complete with $58.56 $66.25 $69.10 $60.35 No Bid
cover
Buffalo Style 5 1/4" x 26"
100 30 EACH |gate box top section w/ $30.94 $35.00 $46.90 $34.50 No Bid
cover
Buffalo Style 5 1/4" x 36" .
101 20 EACH gate box bottom $32.04 $36.25 $32.50 $29.90 No Bid
102 20  |EACH |Buffalo Style 60 24" gate $20.71 $25.00 $31.60 $35.65 No Bid
box extension
3" repair lid for curb box .
103 50 EACH mueller H 10374 or equal $8.75 $9.76 $12.50 $10.35 No Bid
2 1/2" repair lid for curb box .
104 50 EACH Mueller H 10374 or equal $6.82 $8.00 $7.00 $6.90 No Bid
1" valve box adapter w/
105 50 EACH |cover for Buffalo style 60 $14.21 $15.63 $15.50 $14.25 No Bid
gate box
2" valve box adapter w/ o
106 50 EACH |cover for buffalo style 60 $7.67 $8.44 $7.90 $7.47 No Bid
gate box
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO.,, E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT

3" valve box adapter w/o
107 50 EACH |cover for Bufaflo Style 60 $11.54 $12.69 $11.90 $11.20 No Bid

gate box

12" valve box adapter w/ o
108 2 EACH |coverfor Buffalo Style 60 $17.90 $19.69 $22.00 $25.30 No Bid

Gate box
109 200 |EACH féig?ard 5 1/4" gate box $10.80 $11.88 $10.65 $9.75 No Bid
110 50 EACH |Pioneer Style S10 w/cover $14.55 $16.00 $16.25 $16.10 No Bid
111 50 EACH |Pioneer Style S11 w/cover $20.00 $22.00 $22.50 $20.41 No Bid
112 50 EACH |Pioneer Style S20 w/cover $21.88 $24.06 $22.50 $20.70 No Bid
113 50 EACH |Pioneer Style S21 w/cover $30.12 $33.13 $31.00 $28.40 No Bid
114 50 EACH |Pioneer Style S22 w/cover $34.66 $38.13 $37.50 $32.75 No Bid
115 50 |EACH ?52--?2? Top Extensions $17.90 $19.69 $20.45 $17.25 No Bid
116 50  |EAcH [3de Type Top Extensions $22.16 $30.00 $22.00 $17.25 No Bid

51/4"x 12

2 1/2" x 12" Buffalo Service .
117 50 EACH Box Top Ext. wicover $17.05 $18.75 $23.75 $16.10 No Bid
118 40 EACH Hymax clamp 6" $193.68 $184.75 $280.50 No Bid $210.00
119 40 EACH Hymax clamp 8" $219.33 $209.22 $317.60 No Bid $240.00
120 40 EACH Hymax clamp 10" $290.36 $269.15 $408.55 No Bid $295.00
121 40 EACH Hymax clamp 12" $404.74 $317.69 $482.25 No Bid $355.00
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT

WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

C. FIRE HYDRANTS

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO | TI-SALES, | STILES CO., E.J.
ITEM NOJ QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
Fire Hydrant per Town of
122 40 EACH [Milton $1,784.00 $1,518.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

D. BRASS GOODS (ltem 123-232)
COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO., E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT

123 1 EACH |2" Mueller H-15013 $127.00 No Bid $121.47 $114.95 No Bid

124 1 EACH |1 1/2" Mueller H-15013 $77.00 No Bid $73.44 $69.50 No Bid
1" Compression corp. stop

125 45 EACH [Mueller B25008 for use $36.00 No Bid $35.84 $27.00 No Bid
w/saddle
3/4" Compression corp.

126 40 EACH |[stop Muelller B25008 for $27.00 No Bid $27.26 $17.86 No Bid
use w/saddle

127 1 EACH [2" Mueller H10283 $144.00 No Bid $118.18 $163.26 No Bid

128 2 EACH |1 1/2 Mueller H10283 $88.00 No Bid $80.80 $116.13 No Bid
1" Curb stop, Cto C

129 80 EACH |compression Mueller $64.00 No Bid $53.73 $48.37 No Bid
H1504-2
1" Curb stop, Female by

130 50 EACH |Female Meuller H-10283 or $52.00 No Bid $43.16 $37.76 No Bid
equal
3/4" Curb stop, Cto C

131 80 EACH |compression Mueller H- $41.00 No Bid $44.86 $31.34 No Bid
15219 or equal
1 1/2" Compression Male

132 6 EACH |Adapter Mueller H-15428 or $26.00 No Bid $23.99 $23.70 No Bid
equal
1 1/4" Compression Male

133 8 EACH |Adapter Mueller H-15428 or $18.00 No Bid $16.75 $16.55 No Bid
equal
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO., E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
1" Compression x 1" Male
134 100 EACH |Adapter Mueller H-15428 or $10.00 No Bid $9.58 $9.46 No Bid
equal
1" Compression x 3/4" Male
135 100 EACH |Adapter Mueller H-15428 or $9.00 No Bid $8.96 $8.85 No Bid
equal
3/4" Compression Male
136 60 EACH |Adapter Mueller H-15428 or $9.00 No Bid $8.10 $8.00 No Bid
equal
11/2 " Compression Female
137 2 EACH |Adapter Mueller H-15451 or $33.00 No Bid $30.70 $30.33 No Bid
equal
11/4 " Compression Female
138 12 EACH |Adapter Mueller H-15452 or $20.00 No Bid $19.28 $19.04 No Bid
equal
1" Compression x 1"
139 100 EACH |Female Adapter Mueller H- $13.00 No Bid $11.55 $11.41 No Bid
15451 or equal
3/4" Compression x 1"
140 100 EACH |Female Adapter Mueller H- $11.00 No Bid $10.13 $10.00 No Bid
15451 or equal
3/4" Compression Female
141 80 EACH |Adapter Mueller H-15451 or $9.00 No Bid $8.51 $8.40 No Bid
equal
11/2 " Compression Union . .
142 6 EACH Mueller H-15403 or equal $37.00 No Bid $34.48 $34.60 No Bid
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO,, E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
11/4 " Compression Union . .
143 12 EACH Mueller H-15403 or equal $30.00 No Bid $17.79 $17.58 No Bid
1" Compression three part
144 100 EACH |union Mueller H-15403 or $11.00 No Bid $11.27 $11.13 No Bid
equal
3/4" Compression three
145 50 EACH |part union Mueller H-15403 $10.00 No Bid $9.86 $9.73 No Bid
or equal
1" Meter Coupling Mueller . .
146 50 EACH H-10897 or equal $9.50 No Bid $8.10 $6.00 No Bid
3/4" Meter Coupling Mueller . .
147 200 EACH H-10897 or equal $5.88 No Bid $5.26 $3.40 No Bid
5/8" Meter Coupling Mueller . .
148 500 EACH H-10897 or equal $5.34 No Bid $4.63 $2.99 No Bid
149 30 |EAcH [? lreated leather meter $2.00 No Bid $1.06 $1.00 No Bid
washer
150 50  |EAcH |tl/2 treated leather meter $1.50 No Bid $0.80 $0.95 No Bid
washer
151 500 |EACH |} ‘reated leather meter $1.25 No Bid $0.20 $0.30 No Bid
washer
152 1000 |EACH |34 treated leather meter $0.30 No Bid $0.26 $0.19 No Bid
washer
153 5000 |EACH f\//:s;r;ated leather meter $0.25 No Bid $0.25 $0.18 No Bid
154 4 EACH |2"close brass nipple $8.45 No Bid $8.42 $7.93 $7.15
155 4 EACH |2" x 6" brass nipple $20.34 No Bid $20.25 $19.09 $17.00
156 4 EACH |1 1/2" close brass nipple $5.55 No Bid $5.53 $5.21 $4.70
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO,, E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
157 4 EACH |1 1/2" x 2" brass nipple $5.98 No Bid $5.95 $5.61 No Bid
158 4 EACH |1 1/2" x 6" brass nipple $15.83 No Bid $15.75 $14.85 No Bid
159 4 EACH |1 1/4" close brass nipple $4.27 No Bid $4.25 $4.01 No Bid
160 4 EACH |1 1/4" x 6" brass nipple $12.54 No Bid $12.48 $11.77 No Bid
161 60 EACH |1" close brass nipple $2.83 No Bid $2.82 $2.65 $2.40
162 60 EACH |1" x 2" brass nipple $3.49 No Bid $3.48 $3.28 No Bid
163 40 EACH [1" x 6" brass nipple $8.99 No Bid $8.95 $8.44 $7.60
164 100 EACH |3/4" close brass nipple $1.93 No Bid $1.91 $1.80 $1.60
165 100 EACH |3/4" x 2 brass nipple $2.42 No Bid $2.41 $2.27 No Bid
166 60 EACH |3/4" x 6" brass nipple $6.17 No Bid $6.13 $5.78 $5.20
167 60 EACH |1" brass coupling $4.18 No Bid $3.73 $3.62 $3.30
168 60 EACH |3/4" brass coupling $2.75 No Bid $2.46 $2.38 $2.15
169 6 EACH |2 1/2 x 2" brass red. $29.53 No Bid $26.30 $25.55 No Bid
coupling
170 6 EACH |2 1/2" x 1 1/2" brass red. $29.53 No Bid $26.30 $25.55 No Bid
coupling
171 6 EACH |2 1/2" x 1 1/4" brass red. $29.53 No Bid $30.09 $24.43 No Bid
coupling
172 6 EACH |2 1/2" x 1" brass red. $29.53 No Bid $26.30 $24.43 No Bid
coupling
173 6 EACH |% X 1 1/2" brass red. $16.67 No Bid $14.85 $14.43 $13.25
coupling
174 12 |EACH iojpi nlé 4" brass red. $16.67 No Bid $14.85 $14.43 No Bid
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO., E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
175 12 EACH |2" x 1" brass red. coupling $18.78 No Bid $16.73 $16.25 $14.90
176 12 EACH |2 X 3/4" brass red. $18.78 No Bid $16.73 $16.25 $14.90
coupling
177 12 EACH |} 12 x 1 1/4" brass red. $11.22 No Bid $9.99 $9.71 No Bid
coupling
178 12 |eacH |t Y2 x 1" brass red $11.22 No Bid $9.99 $9.71 $8.90
coupling
179 25  |EAcH |* Y4 x 1" brass red, $8.88 No Bid $7.91 $7.68 No Bid
coupling
180 12 |EAcH |} Y4 x 3/4" brass red. $8.88 No Bid $7.91 $7.68 No Bid
coupling
181 50 |EAcH |} X 3/4" brassred. $5.50 No Bid $4.90 $4.76 $4.35
coupling
182 50 |EAcH |¥ X V2" brassred. $5.50 No Bid $4.90 $4.76 No Bid
coupling
183 80  |Eacw |34 x L/2"brass red. $3.32 No Bid $2.95 $2.86 No Bid
coupling
184 6 EACH |2" brass ells $16.95 No Bid $15.11 $14.67 $13.50
185 6 EACH |1 1/2" brass ells $10.42 No Bid $9.28 $9.01 $8.30
186 25 EACH |1 1/4" x 1" brass ells $10.20 No Bid $9.09 $8.83 No Bid
187 25 EACH |1 1/4" x 3/4" brass ells $10.20 No Bid $9.09 $8.83 No Bid
188 25 EACH |1 1/4" brass ells $8.34 No Bid $7.43 $7.22 No Bid
189 80 EACH [1" brass ells $5.25 No Bid $4.67 $5.65 $4.15
190 60 EACH [3/4" brass ells $3.40 No Bid $3.03 $2.94 $2.70
191 60 EACH [1/2" brass ells $2.53 No Bid $2.26 $2.19 No Bid
192 6 EACH |1 1/2" brass ells 45 deg. $11.50 No Bid $10.25 $9.96 $12.00
193 6 EACH |1 1/4" brass ells 45 deg. $9.18 No Bid $8.18 $7.95 No Bid
194 25 EACH |1" brass ells 45 deg. $5.74 No Bid $5.12 $4.97 $5.85

14 of 18




TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
WATER WORKS SUPPLIES - FISCAL YEAR 2012

COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO,, E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
195 25 EACH |3/4" brass ells 45 deg. $3.40 No Bid $3.03 $2.94 $3.55
196 60 EACH [1" x 3/4" brass reducing ells $6.53 No Bid $5.82 $5.65 No Bid
197 80 EACH [1" x 1/2" brass reducing ells $6.53 No Bid $5.82 $5.65 $5.20
108 150  [EACH [3* X 12" brass reducing $3.73 No Bid $3.32 $3.22 No Bid
199 6 EACH |2" x 1 1/2" brass bushing $8.88 No Bid $7.91 $14.43 $7.10
200 6 EACH [2" x 1 1/4" brass bushing $8.88 No Bid $7.91 $14.43 No Bid
201 12 EACH |2" x 1" brass bushing $10.69 No Bid $9.53 $16.25 $8.55
202 6 EACH |2" x 3/4" brass bushing $10.69 No Bid $9.53 $16.25 $8.55
203 12 |EACH tl)uls’fm’él 1/4" brass $5.99 No Bid $5.34 $9.71 No Bid
204 12 EACH |1 1/2" x 1" brass bushing $5.99 No Bid $5.34 $9.71 $4.80
205 12 EACH |1 1/2" x 3/4" brass brushing $7.33 No Bid $6.53 $10.93 $5.90
206 12 EACH |1 1/4" x 1" brass bushing $4.69 No Bid $4.18 $7.68 No Bid
207 12 EACH |1 1/4" x 3/4" brass bushing $4.69 No Bid $4.18 $7.68 No Bid
208 6 EACH |1 1/4" x 1/2" brass bushing $5.67 No Bid $5.04 $9.12 No Bid
209 100 EACH |1" x 3/4" brass bushing $2.75 No Bid $2.46 $4.76 $2.20
210 100 EACH |1" x 1/2" brass bushing $2.75 No Bid $2.46 $4.76 No Bid
211 50 EACH |3/4" x 1/2" brass bushing $1.83 No Bid $1.63 $2.86 No Bid

15 of 18




TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
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COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO,, E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT

212 6 EACH |1 /2" Telsco repair $17.48 No Bid $20.45 $19.87 No Bid

adapter, male

1 1/4" x 6" Dresser . .
213 6 EACH Handband clamp $7.82 No Bid $8.26 $20.53 No Bid
214 6 EACH |2 1/2" brass plug $41.27 No Bid $11.97 $11.63 No Bid
215 6 EACH |2" brass plug $7.85 No Bid $7.00 $6.79 $6.25
216 6 EACH |1 1/2" brass plug $4.98 No Bid $4.44 $4.31 $3.95
217 6 EACH |1 1/4" brass plug $3.90 No Bid $3.48 $3.38 No Bid
218 25 EACH |1" brass plug $2.63 No Bid $2.34 $2.27 $2.05
219 50 EACH |3/4" brass plug $1.99 No Bid $1.78 $1.72 $1.60
220 25 EACH [1/2" brass plug $1.74 No Bid $1.55 $1.51 No Bid
221 12 EACH |1" x 1" x 1" brass tee $7.43 No Bid $6.62 $6.43 $5.95
222 12 EACH |3/4" x 3/4" x 3/4" brass tee $4.18 No Bid $3.73 $3.62 $3.30

2" ball valve, watts, female

threaded, 150 PSI
223 3 EACH [saturated steam 600 PSI, $40.00 No Bid $58.45 No Bid $29.80

water, oil, gas, temperature

range -55° to 450

1 1/2" ball valve, watts,

female threaded, 150 PSI
224 3 EACH [saturated steam 600 PSI, $28.72 No Bid $46.65 No Bid $22.70

water, oil, gas, temperature

range -55° to 450
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COMPANY
FERGUSON VELLANO TI-SALES, | STILES CO,, E.J.
IITEM NOJ] QUANTITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT

1 1/4" ball valve, watts,
female threaded, 150 PSI

225 1 EACH [saturated steam 600 PSI, $19.64 No Bid $36.55 No Bid $17.60
water, oil, gas, temperature
range -55° to 450
3/4" ball valve, watts,
female threaded, 150 PSI

226 100 EACH [saturated steam 600 PSI, $7.09 No Bid $16.50 No Bid $6.20
water, oil, gas, temperature
range -55° to 450
1" ball valve, watts, female
threaded, 150 PSI

227 50 EACH [saturated steam 600 PSI, $11.05 No Bid $20.75 No Bid $9.20
water, oil, gas, temperature
range -55° to 450

228 30  |EACH |} SYle 65 dresser female $18.00 No Bid No Bid $51.72 No Bid
adapter

229 30  |EACH |} SYle 65 dresser male $18.00 No Bid No Bid $21.82 No Bid
adapter

230 30 |EAcH |34 X 6" Handiband $6.83 No Bid $7.36 $11.20 No Bid
coupling

231 30 EACH |1" x 6" Handi band coupling $7.27 No Bid $7.85 $13.21 No Bid

o -
232 30 |EACH (1; ci p’l(i:g Handi band $8.32 No Bid $8.97 $14.01 No Bid
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TOWN OF MILTON WATER DEPARTMENT
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E. PVC SEWER PIPE/CLAY TRANSITION COUPLINGS
COMPANY
FERGUSON | VELLANO | TI-SALES, | STILES CO., E.J.
ITEM NOJ QUANTITY [ UNIT DESCRIPTION WATERWORKS | BROS., INC. INC. INC. PRESCOTT
233 100  |FEET ‘3"5 PVC sewer pipe, S.D.R. $1.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.98
234 500 |FEET 25 PVC sewer pipe, S.D.R. $2.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.10
235 1000 |FEET 25 PVC sewer pipe, S.D.R. $4.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.80
236 100  |FEET ég PVC sewer pipe, SDR.| - 45 g9 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.05
237 3000 |FEET éé PVC sewer pipe, SDR.| - ¢q g9 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.30
4" Fernco clay to PVC pipe, .
238 12 EACH 1056 series $5.00 $3.49 $3.90 $5.50 No Bid
6" Fernco clay to PVC pipe, .
239 12 EACH 1056 series $9.00 $7.46 $8.30 $8.10 No Bid
8" Fernco clay to PVC pipe, .
240 12 EACH 1056 series $13.00 $11.48 $12.75 $14.31 No Bid
10" Fernco clay to PVC .
241 12 EACH pipe. 1056 series $18.00 $17.23 $19.15 $16.90 No Bid
12" Fernco clay to PVC .
242 12 EACH pipe. 1056 series $20.00 $20.11 $22.35 $19.27 No Bid
243 12 EACH |4 4" plastic to plastic $5.00 $3.49 $3.90 $5.50 No Bid
fernco coupling
244 12 EACH |8 6" plastic to plastic $9.00 $7.46 $8.30 $8.10 No Bid
fernco coupling
245 12 EACH & 8" plastic to plastic $13.00 $11.48 $12.75 $14.31 No Bid
fernco coupling
246 12 EACH [10'X10" plastic to plastic $18.00 $17.23 $19.15 $16.90 No Bid
fernco coupling
247 12 |BacH [¥2X12 plastictoplastic | o o, $20.11 $22.35 $19.27 No Bid
fernco coupling
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